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Hundreds
OfPriests
Removed
Since '60s
Siav^ShowsScope
Wder Than Disclosed

AiaN COOPEBMAN
and Lena. H. Sim
WashinffonPmSt^Wntm

The Roman Catholic Church has
removed 218 priests from theirposi
tions thisyear beoxue ofalfegations
ofchild s^nial abuse, butat least 34
known offenders remain i^ church
jobs, accordinjf to a surv^ ofCatho
licdioceses acro^ the United States
byTheWashington Pok

The surv^^ found that atleast
850 U.S. priests have been accused o?
sexual misconduct with minors fiinro
the early1960s,and that more than
350 ofthem were remov^fiW min
istrybefore thisyean . ,

The numbers, v^ch are consider
ablyhi^er thanpr^ouslydi^osed,
not oidy suggest tte scope of the
scandalrockingtte Ca^llc Church
in the United Stotes- but also un
derscore the continuing shortage of
reliable statisticson the church'ssex
abuse problem. Catholic nffiriaia
havesaMthat, as a decentralized in
stitution ofautononunis dioceses, the
church has nowayofcompiling those
figures. ,

The Post conducted its survQr by
contacting each of tlie nation's 178
mainstream Roman Catholic dioc^
es. Mnetyrsix dioceses responded
and 82 did not, de^te repeated
phone calls andemail meMagps. Of
those that did answer The Posfs
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Sun^irfCases
Results ofHie Washin^onPost's
survey of178 Western Rite
dioceses oftheRoman Catholic^
Church in the UnitedStates:

ntO priests placed on
LLO administrative leave or

dismissed this year

QCC priests renioved in
0y9 previousyears

priests accused of sexual
OUO misconduct with minors

since the 1960s

past offenders still
Ot In mini^ry
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(|iio<tion<i. nnl) a few provided in-
fonnalion on financial settlements,
Many (iinresan spokesmen said
they did not krow whether the vic
tims of local priests were boys or
jfirls. leerwderi or small children.
Supplementary data were then
gathered from local newspapers,
chtirch newsleMcrs and diocesan
Websites,

Davirl Clohfssy, national direc
tor of the Sutvivors Network of
'ITiose Abused by Priests (SNAP),
an I l-yenr-o!d tiipporl group (hat
says It has 4,(10(1 members, spec
ulated (hat the lack of information
may reflect a d< liberate strategy to
shieldthe churchfromliability.

"ICaludicrous that you can't get
very, very hasi-: data such as the
numl)cr of prie^.ts who've been de-
fri>ckc<l or the lumber of criminal
or civil abuse cases filed against
priests."Clohes^y said."I thinkany
prudent person would assume the
church has more data than it's shar
ing Hut I also think that the church
is smart enough not to have collect-
e<f daUi. which could be discover
able" by plainlilfs' lawyers in law
suits.

As the near!/ 300 active U.S.
bishops bead for Dallas this week to
debate and votir on a mandatory
polkry toward priests accused of
sexualmiscondu :t. theythemselves
don't know the rrxient of theprob-
•m and have made no real effort to
Ggureit out.
j The bishops' Ad Hoc Com;nit(ce
An Sexual Abuse has proposed, for
Sample,toallow some ofTenders to
Remain in the OithoHc minikry if
they have comnutted only a single
known act of abise in the distant
east,have undergone psychological
reatmcntand hive not beendiag-
iosc<l as pedophiles.

But the comnittee's chairman.
Xrchbishop Harry J. Rynn oi St.
Pauland Minnea;x>Iis. said no one
knows bcjw manypriestsfitthat de-Eiption.

Ilie president of the bi.shops"
iference. Bisho;) Wilton D.Grcg-
nf Belleville,H., said that be is

fommitted togreater transparency,
kut that many ofhis fellow bishops
ire reluctant to provide statistical
jl.->la. fearing they would only lead
I"more bad publicity.
1 'Idmy diocese, luo weeks ago. I
|ave a complete firundal account-

iig for what this hiscost us—legal •
Ws. settlements, counseling for
^ctims. everythini' going back 10
years—and 1did tiat boause peo
ple h.ive a right to know. It's their
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money," Gregory said, "But not ev
ery bishop is there." (Belleville, a
relatively small diocese with
10S.0(K) Clatholics and 180priests,
has spent $3.1 million on lawsuits
and counseling.)

I Among the proposals on the
agendafor the Dallasmeetingis the
setting up of a commission to re
search the church's response to se*
abuse, Flynn's committee has rec
ommended that the bishops require
everydiocese to "developa commu-
niwtions policy that reflects a com-

I mitment to transparency andopen
ness."

At present, however, the U.S.
(Conference of Catholic Bishops
does not keep any nationwide sta
tistics on sexual abuse cases, and in
dividual dioceses vary greatly in
their openness.

The archdioceseof NewOrleans,
for example, respon«icd to the sur
veyby."wying that, overthe past50
years, 18 of its priests have been ac
cused of sexual misconduct with
minors. An independent board of
laypeople reviev^ those records
this year and decided that the alle-
^tions in eight cases were cred
ible. in six cases were not credible
and in four cases required further
investigation. Archbishop Alfred C
Hughes removed 11 priests from
their positions thisyear because of
sexual abuse allegations, and the
archdiocese reported payments of
$455,000 for legalsetliements and
$420,000 forpsychological counsel
ing in abuse cases since 1980.

The archdiocese of Indianapolis,
in contrast, said it had conducted
an "internalreview" of past allega
tions and would not niake public
any of its findings,"We'vemade a
decision not to release names or
numbers. We beUeve that one case
is one loo many, that child abuse is
wrong and that it's not helpful for
people to have numbers." said Su
san Borcherts. spokeswoman for
Archbishop DanielM.Buechlein. .
• Officials in several diocescs said
theyhave a policy ofnotre^nding
to surveys.Some said they would
answer questions only from local
tncfiia, not the national pressJ

Monsignor Gerald Calovinl,
spokesman for the diocese of Steu-
benville. Ohio,saidnoabuseallega
tionsare "nowpetnling" there,but
he declined to discuss how many
Steubenville priests have been ac-
aiscd or how those allegations
were resolved. "We're not talking
aboutcasesin the past.That's con
fidential information." he said.

Generally, church officials were
even lesswilling to talkaboutlegal
settlements. The Postsurveyfound
only$106million inacknowledged
payments. Plaintiffs' lawyers say
thatthetrueFigure is intherangeof

$1 billion, but that most of the set
tlements have been made under

Iconfidentiality agreements.
The survey found that 866

priests have been acniscti of child
sexual abu.se over the past four dec
ades, lessthan 1.5percentof the es
timated 60.000 or more men who
have served in the (Catholic clergy
over that period.

The actual number accused, how
ever. may be considerably higher.
SylviaDemarest, a plaintiffs lawyer
in l^xas. said that she compiled a
database in the mid-1990s of about
1.200 priests who who were ac-
trused of sexual misconduct with
minors, and that she believes the
current figure Is higher than 1,500,

A.W. Richard Sipe, a former
priest turned psychotherapist who
has counseled hundreds of clergy
men and victims of abuse, estimates
that R percent of all U-S. priests
have committed child sexual abuse.
Some church'officials, including

I Cardinal Theodore McCarrick of
I Washington, have citedfigures be

tween 1 percent and 2 percent,
based on a study severalyears ago
of personnel records in the archdio
cese of Chicago.

The scandal that erupted in Janu
ary with the revelations that Bos
ton's Cardinal Bernard l.aw and

^other prelates had transferred
: knownsexoffendersfromparish to

p^h may have created an impres
sion that, in the past, problematic
priests were usually shuHled
around and seldom removed from
ministry altogether. But The I'ost's
survey fotind that, even before this

• year, 35S priests had been removed
! from ministry because ofsex abuse
' allegations.

Of those, however, only a small
percentage were defrocke<i or *la-
tci/ed." the church's term for re
moval from the organized priest
hood.The survey turned up just 20
Uicizations in abuse cases. Mast of
the other offendersapparentlywere
forcedto retire or had their priestly
"faodties" lifted—meaning that
they were not allowed to say Mass-
M publicly or to engagein any min
istry—but theyremained priests.

This year, 218 priests have been
removed from their jobs and not re-
assi^ed.Most have been placed on
administrative leave pending the
outcome of investigations by the
church iilto the allegationsagainst
them.

Catholic leaders have said that
they expect a healed debate at the
Daflasmeeting on the question of
whether past offenders can, under
certain conditions, remain in min
istry.Somebishops,ledbyCardinal
Roger Mahony of Los Angeles, fa
vor a strict 'one strike you're out"
policy. Others, including Cardinal
FrancisGeorgeofChicago,want to
alfcjw exceptions for priests who
have undergone therapy arid have
been veiled by lay review boards
before being relumed to ministry
undercontinuing supervision.

The Post survey foun»l nearly
Uiree dozen such priests across the
country, including a few who have
served prison lime. In most eases,
the past offendersare in .some form
of restricted ministry, workingin
convents, hospitals or administra
tivejobsin which theyarc notsup
posed to have any regular contact
with minors. Many dioceses have
disclosed thepriests'names andpo
sitions to the public,but a fewhave
not

The Rev, Harlan Clap.saddle of
Rockford, 111,, is an example of an
acknowledged offenderwho has re-

Archbishop Harry J. Flynnof St. Paul
and Minneapolis led the draftingof
a proposed policy on sexual abuse.

mained in ministry under supervi
sion. Rockford Bishop Thomas G.
Doran publicly discus.sed the case
last month, announcingthat the di
ocese had paid $80,000 to settle
sexual abuse claims against the
priest.

Doran said that when the charg
es were made against Clapsaddle
about five years ago. he was re
moved from his parish and un
derwent evaluation and treatment
for several months. He was allowed
to return to the diocese, but his
work was restricted to a home for
the elderly and to the localadminis
trative officesof Catholic Charities.
Doran said.

In Grand Rapids. Mich., the Rev.
Don Heydens is also in a restricted
ministry, runningthe diocese'spro
gram for deacons, because of an
abuse incident in (he 1970s. In
Springfield, Mass., the Rev, Rich
ard Meehanis workingas an archi
visteightyearsafterbeingremoved
from his post because of an allega
tion of abuse. In Columbus. Ohio,
Bishop James A, Griffin this year
transferred MonsignorJosephFete
froma parish to the positionof di
rector of ecumenical and interfailh
alfairs because Fete acknowledged
havingasexualrelationship withan
adolescent boy from 1976to 1979,

TTie archdioceseof Chicago has
four past offenders in some form of
ministry. Milwaukee has six whose
names and positions have not been
made public, but whosestatus is un
der reviewby a lay panel.The dio
ceseof (Covington, Ky„ disclosedin
March that three of its 110 priests
remain in restricted assignments
"after allegations of misconducl
with teenagers." Their names and
jobshavenot beenmadepublic.

How many other offenders hold
church positioas with the quiet
knowledge of (Catholicleaders is un
clear because some bishops still
treat such cases with the utmost se
crecy. The Rev, Gerald (Calhoun,
the vicar general, or second-rank-
ing official. In the diocese of Owens-
boro. Ky.. said he suiqjects that
there are two priesU in restricted
ministry there. "ButI don't know,"
he said. "Only the bishop would
know,"


